BID NO: RFQ-05-43
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/20/08

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

IRRIGATION SUPFLIES - ATHLETIC|BIDDER NO 1 BIODDER ND 2
FIZELDS RENOVATION FERGUSON WATERWORKS JOHN DEERE LANDOSCAPE
WINTER HAVEN, FL. TAMPA, FL

fTEM |QUANT |DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL FRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE|

A 14 {Hunler IC8-210G 11315 31,584.10 80.389 51,125.45

B 124  |Hunter 125-04 30.20 53,744.80 21.494 £2,665.26

C 14 [D1200-0LSG - 12° reclanguiar viv b 15,00 £230.00 11.589 5167.85

—D 250 |Kal-Flex 3" 1.152 5280.00 a.5os 5127.25
E 5 725 Blue Glue {Gallon) 2370 5118.50 25608 $128.04

I3 25 |Uniweld Cleaner {Gallon) 21.80 $21.90 16.99 42.475

[=] 45 {Purpla Primer (Galior) 2500 $26.00 20.646 51.618§]

H 5 Teflop 3/4" G.4B8 52.40 4.255 1.278

r_ 16 [11/4" g0 0.44 57.04 0.388 §5.88
J § 4490 4.80 52400 4.029 520.15

K k| 3" 00 270 $724.30 2.253 520.28

L 9 4" Caupling 220 $18.80 1.847 $16.82

M 4 3" Coupling 1.60 £6.40 1277 5511

_z 1 3" Tee 4400 54,00 3307 5331
o 5 2" Tes 0.93 54,65 0.763 53.82]

P 4 114" Tee £.52 52.08 0.431 51.73

Q 18 TR %1 14" Tee 1.00 51500 &8 514.79

rm 20 2"x11/4" Tee 1.00 520.00 0.816 $16.32
S 14 212" x11/4" Tes 350 549,00 251 535.14

T kP J"x11/4" Tee 5.00 $160.00 3.595 $115.04

ju 14 4" x11/4" Tae B.30 §116.20 5.981 583.73
\a L] 4" x 2" Tea 7.0 583.90 4,681 553,83

W 124 | 1 14" x 1" Reducer Bushing 032 539.68 0263 32612

X 14 11/2" x 1 1/4” Reducer Bushing 034 54.76 0278 53.89]

Y 18 2"x 1 1/4" Reducer Bushing 0.55 $10.45 0.463 SB.80]

Z 3 2"x 1 1/2" Reducer Bushing 0.55 53.30 0.463 52,78

AL 13 | 2 12" % 2" Reducer Bushing 0,96 $11.70 0.741 $9.63

=[] 1 3" x 2" Reducer Bushing 1.3 §1.31 1.082 1.082|

CC 13 3"x 2 112" Raducer Bushing 1.30 $16.80 1.092 514.20

JUD 13 4"x 2" Reducer Bushing 2.80 $37.70 2.444 §31.77,
EE 4 4"x 3" Redweer Bushing 2.80 51180 2.444 59,78

FF 28 2" Male Adapler 048 513.44 0.398 51114

GG 125 | 1" Streetell 0.53 566.25 0.443 &55.38

-II 1400 |PVC Pipe SCHAD 1 174" 8.2g S408.00 0,329 $460.60
I3 1320 |PVC Fipa SCH4G 1 112™ .28 $368.60 .322 S$425.04

JJ 1540 {PVC Fipa SCH40 2* 0.41 S631.40 0.425 5654.50

KK 1000 |PVC Plpe SCHA0 2 2™ 0.77 770,00 n.&78 $678.00

—F 1880 |PVC Pipa SCH40 3" 0.85 $1,428.00 0.208 $1,525.44
M 2060 |PVC Pipe SCH40 4" 1.13 52,327.60 1.288 $2,675.84

NN 14  |Hunler ICD-100 90,15 51,262,140 G4.053 S896.74

[aln] 0 |DER-G 1,70 $51.00 1.759 $52.77

J_um_ 30 |DBY 1.15 $34.50 1.00 £3C.00
Q0 ] Ground Rod 58" 8' 14.00 $84.00 14.368 5BG.21

RR b Cadweld GR1161GPLYS 6.80 534.00 9.185 545.98

S5 5 #6 Brass Spht Boll 1.85 £9.75 3181 5156.81

7T 50 |#4 Bare Copper Wire 0.43 $21.50 0.528 526.40

Total ltems A-TT[**Bid Alt Slze lem F& G 514,181.81 5$12.460.43

| DELIVERY TIME: Within 3 days Within 5 days
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BHD NO: RFQ-09-43
DATE CLOQSED: 2:00 P.M., 0B/20/08

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATICN OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

IRRIGATION SUPPLIES - ATHLETIC{RIDBER NO 3 BIDDER NO 4
FIELDS RENOVATION COAST PUMP & SUFPLY TWC DISTRIBUTORS
VENICE, FL DOVER, FL

ITEM JQUANT [DESCRIPTICN UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT FRICE TOTAL PRICE
A 14 |Hunler ICB-210G B82.64 $1,146.56 78.48 5111272
B 124  |Hunier |25-24 2164 $2,683.36 21.25 52.635.00
i 14 [DM200-0L5G - 12" rectangular viv bd 14.75 5208.50 13.20 51684.80
C 260 |Kel-Fiex 1" 48,33 $241.65 0.627 3156.75
E 6 [725 Blue Glus (Gallon) 24,74 5123.70 29.18 5145.85
F 26 |Uniwald Cleanar (Gallon) 31.88 575.65 1478 536.85
G 25 JPurple Pimer (Gallon) 34,74 586,85 19.59 £49.23
H 5 [Teflon 3/4" 0.65 53.25 1.00 $5.00
| 18 (113/4" 80 0.20 $4.80 0.502 56.03
J 5 4780 3.27 516.35 5.ar 526.25
K g 3" 80 1.683 516.47 288 £26.55
L ] 4" Coupling 1.50 513.50 2.42 £21.78
m 4 3" Coupling 1.08 a4.24 1.67 S5.65|
N 1 3" Tee 275 5275 4.33 54.33]
sl & 2" Tea 8.63 52156 089 54,85
= 4 114" Tee Q.35 51.40 0.57 52.28
o] 19 11727 x 1 1/4" Tee 0.71 513.48 1.08 52071
R 20 2"%1 144" Tee 0.70 $14.00 1.07 $21.40
15 14 212 x 1 1/4" Tee 216 530.24 328 545,92
T 32 3% 1 114" Tee ang sh8.B8 4.70 5150.40

U 14 [ 4"%11/4" Tee 5.15 $72.10 7.82 m._om.amr
v g x2" Tea 515 548,35 7.82 570,38
W 124 | % 1/4"x 1" Reducer Bushing 0.22 527.28 0.35 543.40
X 14 [ 112"x 1 1/4" Reducer Bushing .24 53.36 0.37 55,18
Y 19 {2"x1 1/4" Reducer Bushing 0.38] 57.4% 0.81 511,58
Z L] 2" % 1 112" Reducer Bushing 0,39 52.34 041 S3.66
AA 13 2 1/2" x 2" Reducer Bushing 0.64 $8.32 097 512.61
rmm 1 3" x 2" Reducer Bushing 0.84 $0.94 143 51.43

CcC A=) 3% 2 1/2" Reducer Bushing 1k $12.22 1.43 m._m.mm‘
[uln] 13 4"x 2" Reducer Bushing 210 $27.30 3.28 $41.60
EE 4 4"x 3" Reducer Bushing 2.10 §8.40 3.20 812.80
rm_u 2B 2" Male Adapter 0.34 58.52 0.52 §14.56,
GG 126 { 1" Strestel 0,38 547.50 0.58 37250
&3] 1400 [PVC Pipe SCH40 1 144" 0.41 $574.00 0.282 §384.80
J__ 1320 |PVC Pipe SCH40 1 1/2™ 0,38 S506.88 0.29 £384.12
i 1540 |PVC Pipe SCH40 2" 0.29 $600.60 0.375 5577.50
K 1000 [PVC Pipe SCH40 2 172 085 5850.00 0648 5648.00
LL 1680 [PVC Pipe SCH4D 3" 083 £1,562.40 0.873 51,466.64
JZK 2060 |PVC Pipe SCH4D 4" 1.38 $2,842.80 1.147 $2,362.82
NN 14 |#untar ICD-100 66.64 $632.95 8323 SBB&.62
00 a0 |OBR-6 1.48 542.00 1,83 554.90
PP A (DBY 1.02 530,60 1.00 53000
Qc [ Ground Red /8" 8 17.65 5105.80 17.00 5102.00,
RR 5 Cadweld GR1161GPLUS 10.58 $52.90 10.00 550.00,
S5 -] #6 Brass Split Boll 222 511,10 4.25 521,25
T &0 |36 Bara Copper Wire 142,60 $142.50 0.293 519.55
Total ltems A-TT $13,328.87 512,081.76

DELIVERY TIME: Within 1-6 days —
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BID NO: RFQ-09-43
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., DB/20/08

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TQ

IRRIGATION SUPPLIES - ATHLETIC|BIDRDER NO 5 BIDCER NQ &
FIELDS RENOVATICN DUNHAM WELL DRILLING RITE-FLG SUPPLY
WINTER HAVEN, FL LAKELAND, FL
{TEM |QUANT |DESCRIPTION UNIT FRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL FRICE|
1A 14 |Hunter ICB-210G 91.48 5§1,280.72 BG.42 51,209,868
=] 124  {Hunter 125-04 32.02 53,570.48 23141 52,865.64
Cc 14 |D1200-0LSG - 12° rattangular viv bo 16.81 5235.34 1687 §237.50
D 250 |Kaf-Flex 1" 04,14 $210.43 0.56 §140.00
E § 725 Blus Glue (Gallon) 32.36 $161.80 2621 $131.08
F 26 |Uni-weld Cleaner (Gallon) 21.83 54.075 16.59 $41.48)
G 2.5 [Purpla Primer (Gallon) 2275 56.875 2296 SE7.40)
H & Teflon 344" 1.06 55,30 Q7 5385
| 16 |1 1/4"90 0.55 56,80 0778 $12.45
J 5 4" 80 .05 33030 4.24 521.20
i 9 3"80 339 $30.51 2.38 521.42
i 3 4" Couj 278 §25.02 1.85 517,55
M 4 3" Coupling 1.82 57.68 1.25 55.40;
N 1 3" Tee 4.97 £4.97 348 £3.48
(4] 5 2"Tee 1.5 85,75 o] $4.00
:v 4 |13 Tee 06 254 D.d5 §1.80
Q 19 112" x11/4" Tee 1.25 S23.75 o.88 816.72]
R 20 | 2'x 114" Tea 123 524.60 0.88 $17.20
S 14 212" x 1 114" Tes 37T s52.78 2.65 £37.10
T 32 3" 11/4" Jea 541 517312 3.60 $121.60
U 14 4“x 114" Tea 8.89 $125.86 6.31 SB8.34
v g 4" x 2 Tae 8.0y 580,91 6.3 5568.78
W 124 {1 1/4"x 1" Reducer Bushing 0,40 548860 0.282 534.97
X 14 11/2" % 1 114" Reducer Bushing 0.43 £6.02 0.30 £4.20
Al 18 2" x 1 1/4" Reducer Bushing D0.70 513,30 0.49 59.31
r B 2% % 172" Recducer Bushing .70 $4.20 D49 §2.84
AM 13 2 1/2" x 2" Reducer Bushing 1.12 514.56 o.78 51014
BE 1 3" x 2" Reducar Bushing 1.64 51.54 1.15 51.15
GC 13 3"x 2 112" Reducer Bushing $.64 £21.32 1.15 $14.95
0D 13 4"x 2" Reducer Bushing 368 547.84 257 KRR
EE 4 4"x 3" Reducer Bushing 3.68 $14.72 2.57 514.28
FF 28 2" Mala Adapter 0.60 516.80 042 511,78
GG 128 | 1" Sirestell 0.67 583.75 047 $58.75
HH 1400 |FVC Pipp SCH40 7 144" 28,67 $401.37 0,358 5502.60
Il 1320 |PVC Pipe SCH40 1 /2™ 34.29 $452.68 0.28 5382.80
2 1640 |PVC Pips SCH4D 2" 46.08 $708.81 0.35 $600.80
KK 1000 |PVC Fipa SCH4AD 2 172 83,61 292690 0.72 s720.00
LL 1680 |PVC Flipa SCH40 5° 83.84 $1,576.51 0.87 5$1,461.60
MM 2060 [PVC Plpe SCHAD 4 162.05 5$3,330.51 1.15 $2,369.00
NN 14 |Hunter ICD-102 72.83 $1,019.52 B6B.86 £864.04}
oo 30 |DBRE 214 564,20 1.8 554.00
FP M DBY 1.34 534.20 3.60 54B.00
Qo ] Ground Rod 5/8"x 8' 1668 5100.08 17.3 5103.86
RR & Cadweld GR161GFLUS 14.84 574.20 17,00 $85.80
55 & #6 Brass Split Bolt 808 54530 3416 $17.08
TT 50  [#6 Bare Capper Wire 1.85 598.00 0.69 £34.50
Talal tems A - TT| $15,895.02 512,848.87|
DELIVERY TIME: Within 7 days Within & days
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BID NO: RFQ-039-43 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED 7O

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/20/09 TABULATION OF BIDS
IRRIGATION SUPPLIES - ATHLETIC|BIODER ND 7 BIDDER NO &
FIELDS RENOVATION MO SURPPLY POLK PUMP & IRRIGATION
LAKELAND, FL LAKELAND, FL
ITEM [QUANT |DESCRIFTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE LINIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A 14 |Hunler{CB-210G NO BID NO BID 103.59 $1,450.26
B 124 |Hunter(25-04 ' NO BID NO BID 27.70 53,434.80
c 14 |D1200-0LSG - 12“ rectangular viv 17.56888 524824 14.47 5202.58,
B 250  [Kaf-Flex 1 NGO BID NO BID 070 $175.00
I3 5 725 Blua Glue (Gellcn) 25322 5126.61 kYA Ki 5185.65)
F 2,5 |Uni-wald Cleaner {Galion} NO BID NG BiD: 564.58
G 28 [Purpte Primer (Gallon} 13.883 5347 587.40
H 5 Teflan 374" 111 55.56 1.34 56.70]
—_ 18 [11/4"80 .432 56.91 0.57 59.12
J 5 4"90 4757 82379 5.18 530.80
K ] 3'90 2.687 32418 346 sa114]
L ] 4" Coupfing 2.366 §2129 2.84 $25.56,
M 4 2* Caupling 1.662 5B6.65 1.96 S7.84
N 1 3" Tea 3.684 53.88 5.08 55.08
Q & 2" Tes 0.688 54.48 1.18 55.90;
P 4 1 174" Tea 0.508 52.02 0&7 £2.68
Q 19 112" % 1 14" Tea 1.38 526.41 1.28 534.32
R 20 2"x11/4" Tas 1.377 537.54 126 $35.20
k3 143 212 x 1 114" Tee 4211 558.95 J.86 554.04
#._. 32 3" % 3 114" Tee 5.029 $182.93 552 5176.84
U 14 4"x1 1/4" Ten 10.04 5140.56 9.17 5126.38
A ] 4"x 2" Tes 10,04 590,36 9.17 58253
\id 124 | 1 1/4"x 1" Reducer Bushing ] 53B.44 0.41 $50.84
X 14 112" % 1 174" Reducer Bushing 4.365 8511 0.43 56.02
id 13 2" % 1 1/4" Reducer Bushing 0.544 516.34 a.71 513.48
Z 8 2" x 1 1/2" Reducer Bushing 0.678 54.07 071 54.25)
AA 13 2 112" x 2" Reducer Sushing 0.872 $11.34 1.14 514.52
Jmm 1 | 3*x 2" Reducer Bushing 1.282 51.28 1.66 s1.68
cC 13 3"x 2 1/2" Redueer Bushing 1.832 523.82 1.68 521.84,
[n]i} Rk 4"x 2" Reducer Bushing 3.183 541.38 a78 84875
EE 4 4"y 3" Raducer Bushing 2935 511,74 374 $15,00
rmﬂ | 2" Male Adapter 0.476 $13.33 0.62 517.36
GG 125 | 1" Straetall .77 £86.25 088 585.00
HH 1400 |PVC Pipa SCH40 1 114" 0.328 5455.4D 0,37 mm._m.omr
) 1320 [PVC Pipa SCH40 1 2™ 0268 335376 038 $501.60
RE] 1540 (PVC Pipe SCH40 2" £.386 £504.44 0.49 $754.60
KK 1000 |PVYC Pipe SCH40 2 172 0.651 5661.00 0.84 $840.00,
LL 1680 |PVC Pipe SCH40 3" . 0.851 §1,425.688 1.07 51,797,560
—_s_s 2060 |PVC Pipe SCH40 4" 1176 $2,422.56 1.40 $2.884.00
N 14 |Huntar [CD-120 NO BID NO BID 82.54 5$1,155.56
00 W [PERG NO BID NO BID 244 57320
PP 30 |OBY NGO BID: NO BID 1.24 540.20
Qc L] Ground Rod 5/8"x 8 NO BID NO BID 2287 mL_wm.omr
IRR 5 Cadwald GR1161GPLUS NO BID NO BID 1333 $66.65)
55 5 #8 Brass Split Boft NO BID NO BID 567 $28.35
T B0  |#6 Bare Coppar Wire NOBID NO BID 0.53 526.50
Total Hems A-TT iincomplele 515817.74
DELIVERY TIME: Within 3 days Within & days
e
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BID NO: RFQ-09-43

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/20/09

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

IRRIGATION SUPPLIES - ATHLETIC|B{SDER NO @ BIDDER NO
FIELDS RENOVATION TERMINE'S FIPE & PLUMBING
MELBOURNE, FL

ITEM |QUANT [DESCRIFTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
A 14 |HunterICB-210G NOBID NG 8I0
Jm 124 |Hunter 12504 NO BID NG BID
C 14 |D1200-0LSG - 12" rectangular viv b 16.4075 53228.71
] 260  |#al-Flax 1" NO BIC NO BID
IE b 725 Blue Glua {Gallon} ND RID NOBID
F 28  |Uni-wald Cleaner {Galion) NOBID NO BT
G 2.6 [Purple Primer (Gallon) NOBID NOD BID
H 5 |Teflon 3/4" .8 £3.00
| 16 [11/4"860 05114 58,18
il [ 4"90 5.5835 527.82
K 9 390 31217 $28.10
L 9 4" Coupling 2.5599 22304
] 4 3" Coupiing 1.7702 $7.08
N 1 3" Tee 4.5818 54.58
O B 2" Tes 1.0573 55.26
P 4 114" Tea 0.5989 52,40
a 18 112" % 114" Tee 1.1501 52185
R Fal 2" 1 1/4" Tee 1.1315 $22.63
5 14 Z21/2"x11{4" Tee 34754 348,71
T a2 3x11/4" Tea 4.982 5159.42
) 14 4"x11/4" Tea B.2865 5116.81
A ] 4" x 2" Tee 8,2865 $74.58
W 124 | 1 174" x 1" Reducer Bushing 0.3683 S45.67
X 14 | 11/2°x 1 1/4" Reducer Bushing 0.3869 55.42
Y 18 [ 2"x 1 1/4" Reducer Bushing 0.6413 51218
2 5} 2" x 11/2" Raducer Bushing 0.6413 53.85
AR 13 2 1/2" x 2" Reducer Bushing 1.0282 5$13.37
BB 1 3" % 2" Reducer Bushing 1.5158 5152
cC kK] 3"x 2 1/2“ Reducer Bushing 1.5158 §19.71
Jnﬁ_ 13 4"% 4" Reducer Bushing 3.3B67 $44.03
EE 4 4"x 3" Reducer Bushing 3.3867 513.55
FF 20 2" Male Adzpler 0.5512 $15.43
GG 126 | 1" Sirestell 0.855¢ $106.88
HH 1400 |PVC Plpa SCH40 1 1/4* NOBID NO BID
| [l 1320 |PVC Fipe SCH40 3 1/2™ 24,63 $328,12
JJ 1640 |PVC Pipe SCH40 2~ 32.68 $602.27
K 1000 |PVC Pipe SCH40 2 1/2™ 70.00 £700,00
LL 1680 |PVC Pipe SCH4D 3" 60,21 $1,146,83
MM 2080 |PVC Pipa BCH40 47 93,32 $1,922.39
NN 14 fHunler }CG-100 NOBID NOBID
oo 3t |DBR-6 NOBID NO BID
PP 30 |DBY NO BID NO BID
QQ ] Ground Rad 5/8°x & NOBID NGO 81D
RR 1 Cadweld GR1161GPLUS NO BID NO BID
55 5  [#5 Brass Splil Bolt NG 8ID NO BID
LEl 60 |#6 Bare Copper Wire NO BID NC 810
Total tems A-TT INCOMPLETE

DELUVERY TIME:

AWARDED TG

Date: m -2 n\ IHOM



