BID NO: RFQ-09-39
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/27/09

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

ANNUAL CONTRACT - FIRE BIDDER NO 1 BIDDER NO 2 BIDDER NO 3 BIDDER NO 4
EXTINGUISHER SALES & SVC CINTAS CORPORATION SAFETY TRAINING & CONS |FIREMASTER RIDGE FIRE EQUIPMENT
TAMPA, FL LAKELAND, FL TAMPA, FL LAKE WALES, FL
DESCRIPTION ABC  CO2 HALON/ALT [ABC  C€O2 HALON/ALT |[ABC  CO2 HALON/ALT [ABC  CO2 HALON/ALT
[FART1 NEW EQUIPMENT
2 1/2- LB 3500 NOBID 125.00 2345 NOBID 7365 [32.83 NOBID NOBID (2500 NOBID 8500
5-LB 5000  137.00 180.00 2041 11118 12547 |41.75 140.93 173.75 3200 140.00 125.00
10-LB 7000 175.00 380.00 48.41 14706 267.76 |60.67 18557 NOBID  |53.00 14500 300.00
15-LB NOBID 200.00 615.00 NOBID 17412 38076 |NOBID 21855 NOBID |[NOBID 17500 NO BID
20-LB 100.00 28000 1,300.00 |88.12  219.88 NOBID [103.57 27250 NOBID  [90.00 21500 NOBID
50-.8 1,400.00 NOBID NOBID |88476 1,218.53 NOBID |1,645.50 NO BID NOBID  [1,400.00 1,895.00 NO BID
125-.8 2,000.00 NOBID NOBID  |1,627.58 NOBID NOBID [2,750.75 NOBIDNOBID |2,150.00 NOBID NO BID
CABINET
5-LB $60.00 $30.13 $116.65 $30.00
10-LB $90.00 $30.13 $116.65 $30.00
MARKERS/ARROWS $6.00 0 $5.00 0
IPART 2 MAINTENANCE
RECHARGE
21/2-LB NOBID NOBID 25.00/L8 |0 NOBID OB |0 NOBID 35.00/LB |0 NO BID OB
5-LB 10.25  19.60 0 NO BID 0 0 0 10.00
10-LB 13.85  23.80 0 0 0 0 0 20.00
15-L8 NOBID 26.60 NOBID O NOBID 0 0 30.00
20-L8 2595  32.20 0 0 0 0 0 40.00
125-LB 52150 NO BID 25000 NOBID NOBID NOBID 27500  NOBID
SERVIGE
ANNUAL INSPECTION/RETAG
ABC §4.25 $9.70 $10.75 $8.00
PW $4.25 $9.70 $10.75 $8.00
HALON/ALT $4.25 $9.70 $10.75 $8.00
coz $4.25 $9.70 $10.75 58.00
AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEM/ $150.00 $65,00 $125.00 NO BID
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BID NO: RFQ-09-39
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/27/0%

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

ANNUAL CONTRACT - FIRE
EXTINGUISHER SALES & 5VC

BIDDER NO %
CINTAS CORPORATION
TAMPA, FL

BIDDER NO 2
SAFETY TRAINING & CONS
LAKELAND, FL

BIDDER NO 3
FIREMASTER
TAMPA, FL

BIDDER NO 4
RIDGE FIRE EQUIPMENT
LAKE WALES, FL

DESCRIPTION ABC HALON/ALT CO2 |ABC HALON/ALT  CO2 |ABC HALON/ALT CO2 ABC HALON/ALT CO2
SERVICE CONTINUED

SIX YEAR MAINTENANCE

ABC $11.00 0 0 0

PW $11.00 0 0 NO BID

HALON/ALT $11.00 0 0 NO BID

coz NOBID 0 0 NO BiD

AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEM/HOODSI{NO BID 0 NO BID NO BiD

HYDROSTATIC TESTING

ABC $12.00 0 0 0

W $12.00 0 0 0

HALON/ALT $12.00 0 0 0

co2 §12.00 0 0 $14.50

AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEM/HOODS|$45.00 0 NO BID NOBID

COST OF SERVICE CALL OTHER

THAN MAINTENANCE: 532.00 0 $45.00 515.00

COST TO REMOUNT/RELOCATE: |36.00 a $5.00 0

REPONSE TIME: 24 HOURS 24 HOURS SAME DAY SAME DAY

Prepared by \ m\\ N\.
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BID NO: RFQ-08-39
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/27/09

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

ANNUAL CONTRACT - FIRE BIDDERNO 5 BIDDER NO 6 BIDDER NO BIDDER NO
EXTINGUISHER SALES & SVC FLORIDA FIRE SERVICE HAINES CITY FIRE
BRANDON, FL WINTER HAVEN, FL
DESCRIPTION ABC C02 HALON/ALT JABC C02 HALON/ALT [ABC CO2 HALON/ALT |ABC C0O2 HALON/ALT
PART1 NEW EQUIPMENT
21/2-1B 2315 NOBID NOBID {1465 NOBID 9585
5-LB 2005 9850 98.10 2385 78.85 NOBID
10-L8 4400  145.00 NOBID 3585 115.85 NOBID
15-LB NOBID 168.50 NO BID NOBID 139.85 NOBID
20-LB 8840  207.40 NOBID 7485 17485 NOBID
50-LB 986.70 1,329.35 NO BID 74285 82585 NOBID
125-LB 1,595.00 NOBID NOBID  [1,363.85 NOBID NOBID
CABINET
5.LB $23,50 $19.95
10-LB $27.80 519.85
MARKERS/ARROWS 0 ]
PART 2 MAINTENANCE
RECHARGE
21/2-LB 0 NOBID NOBID [0 NO BID 0/LB
518 0 0 0 o
10-LB 0 ] 0 0
15-LB ] 0 NOBID 0
20-LB ] i} ] 0
125-LB ] NQ BID 0 0
SERVICE
ANNUAL INSPECTION/RETAG
ABC 58.75 54,85
PW o i} 0
HALON/ALT a a 0
co2 0 0 0
AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEM/ 38.75 0 0
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BID NO: RFQ-08-39 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 08/27/09 TABULATION OF BIDS
ANNUAL CONTRACT - FIRE BIDDER NO 5 BIDDER NO 6 BIDDER NO BIDDER NO
EXTINGUISHER SALES & SVC FLORIDA FIRE SERVICE HAINES CITY FIRE
BRANDON, FL WINTER HAVEN, FL
DESCRIPTION ABC HALON/ALT CO2 |ABC HALON/ALT €02 |ABC HALON/ALT C€O2  |ABC HALON/ALT €O2
SERVICE CONTINUED

SIX YEAR MAINTENANCE

ABC 0 0

PW NO BID NQ BID
HALONI/ALT NO BID 0

coz2 NO BID NO BID
AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEM/HOODS|NO BID NO BID
HYDROSTATIC TESTING

ABC 0 0

PW 0 0
HALON/ALT 0 0

coz2 0 0
AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEM/HOODS|0 0

COST OF SERVICE CALL OTHER

THAN MAINTENANCE: 0 0
COST TO REMOUNT/RELOCATE: |0 0
REPQONSE TIME: 2 DAYS SAME DAY
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