BID NO: RFQ-09-45 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/09 TABULATION OF BIDS
Guns BIDDER NO 1 BIDDER NO 2
Kiesler Palice Supply, Inc. Lawmen's Shooters
Jeffersonville, IN Vera Beach, FL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Bushmasier Patrolmans Carbine
A BO Total delivered price $739.80 $59,184.00 $850.44 $68,035.20§
80 Pick up at location Na Bid No Bid $847.00 $67,760.00§
Delivery Time Within 30-45 days Within 45-60 days
Guns BIDDER NO 3 BIDDER NO 4
B & H Gun Rack, Inc. Jerry's Sport Center
Merritt Island, FL Forest City, PA
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bushmaster Patralmans Carbine
80 Total delivered price $705.55 $56,444.00 £705.85 $56,476.00
BO Pick up at location $705.55 $56,444.00 No Bid No Bid}

Delivery Time Within 30 days or less Within 30-45 days

Prepared by \Nﬁ\ \N\.\\\Kv\ ] Date: .\\.\ W.,\.mwxw
P /



BID NO: RFQ-09-45
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/09
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Guns BIDDER NC 5 BIDDER NO &
. Oaks Wholesale Dist. James Wright dba Tactical
Rockledge, FL Carlisle, KY
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Bushmaster Patrolmans Carbine
A 80 Total delivered price $730.00 $58,400.00 $728.60 $58,368.00§
80 Pick up at location Neo Bid Na Bid No bid No Bidj
Delivery Time Within 30-45 days Within 45 days
Guns BIDDER NO 7 BIDDER NC 8
G T Distributors of GA, inc. Clyde Armory, Inc.
Rossville, GA Beqgart, GA
JITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE]
Bushmaster Patrelmans Carbine
80 Total delivered price $705.46 $56,436.80 $715.83 $57,266.40
a0 Pick up at [ocation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time Within 45-60 days Within 30 days
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BID NO: RFQ-09-45 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/09 TABULATION OF BIDS
Guns BIDDERNOQ B BIDDER NO 10
Personal Protection Group, LLC Leu's Police Distributors
Orange, CT Hialeah, FL
JITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Bushmaster Patrolmans Carbine
A 80 Total delivered price §740.25 $59,220.00 $685.00 $54,800.00
80 Pick up at location Mo Bid No Bid No bid No Bid
Delivery Time Within 30-45 days Within 30-45 days
Guns BIDDER NO 11 BIDDER NO 12
Amchar Whoiesale, Inc. Bushmaster Firearms
Rochester, NY Windham, ME
HTEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Bushmaster Pairolmans Carbine
80 Total delivered price $704.30 $56,344.00 $930.00 574,400,008
ao Pick up at location $704.30 $56,344.00 No Bid Ne Bid}

Delivery Time Within 30-45 days Within 30-45 days
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BID NO: RFQ-09-45
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/09

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

Guns BIDDER NO 13 BIDDER NO
ProForce Law Enforcement
Prescott, AZ
JITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Bushmaster Patrolmans Carbine
A 80 Total delivered price $699.73 $55,978.40
80 Pick up at location No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time Within 30-45 days
) Guns BIDDER NO BIDDER NO
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Bushmaster Patrolmans Carbine
80 Total deliverad price
ao Pick up at location
Delivery Time
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