BID NO: ITB-10-04 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 021110 TABULATION OF BIDS
ANNLIAL CONTRACT - BIDDER NO 1 BIDDER NC 2
GASOLINEDIESEL FUEL HIGHLANDS OIL 55| Petraleum
EST LAKE WALES, FL Winter Haven, FL
JTENQUANT DESCRIPTION BID RACK PRICE _FIXED FEE  |PRICE/GAL TOTAL BID RACK PRICE _ FIXED FEE _ |PRICE/GAL TOTAL
FULL LOAD
A 175000|GAL REG £-10 GAS 87 OCTANE  [1.9910 0.0540 2,045 $357,875.00 |1.8899 0568 2.0464 $358,120.00
e 130000|GAL LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL (2.0345 0.0540 2.0885 $271,505.00 |2.011 0565 2.0675 $268,775.00
TOTAL ITEMS A-B $629,380.00 $626,895.00

TANK WAGON DELIVERIES

ic 10000{GAL OFF RD LOW SULFUR 2.0275 0.1350 2.1625 §21,625.00 |2.016 .15 2.166 $21,660.00
DYED DIESEL
o 5000 (VARIOUS 0.1350 5675.00 A5 §750.00

ALTERNATE BID

Jm UNKNOWN B89 BIODIESEL FOR BLENDING |No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
WITH DYED DIESEL FUEL
IF NOT PER GAL BEL FEE,

SPECIFY ADD'L COST PER LOAD No Bid No Bid

FOR BIODIESEL
TOTAL ITEMS A-D $651,680.00 $645,305.00

YEARLY ESCALATOR, NOT TO
EXCEED 10% 5%

DELIVERY TIME Within one day Within one day

Prepared by \Cﬂq\\“&&\\d 1 Date:_ 2 —/ 7/
A e




BID NO: ITB-10-04
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 02/11/110

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

ANNUAL CONTRACT - BIDDER NG 3 BIDDER NO 4
GASOLINE/DIESEL FUEL RKA Petroteum Companies, Inc. Paimdale Cil Company
EST Romutus, Mi Ft. Pierce, FL
[ TENQUANT DESCRIFTION BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE :um_om:.u_}_. TOTAL BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE PRICE/GAL TOTAL
FULL LOAD
A 175000|GAL REG E-10 GAS 87 OCTANE  |1.9708 2.0342 $355,985.00 {2.0307 0.0135 2.0442 $357,735.00
B 130000|GAL LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL (2.0479 2.1115 $274,495.00 |2.0552 .0356 2.0908 5271,804.C0
TOTAL ITEMS A-B $630,480.00 $629,539.00
TANK WAGON DELIVERIES
JO 10000|GAL OFF RD LOW SULFUR 2.01189 2.2155 $22,155.00 2.0552 .25 2.3052 $23,052.00
DYED DIESEL
[ 500C (VARIOUS $1,329.00 .25 $1,250.00
ALTERNATE BID
JE |UNKNOWN |B98 BIODIESEL FOR BLENDING |1.9744 2.2402 1.9418 .0586 2.0005
WITH DYED DIESEL FUEL
IF NOT PER GAL DEL FEE,
SPECIFY ADD'L COST PER LOAD $35.00 No Bid
FOR BICDIESEL
TOTAL ITEMS A-D $653,964.00 $653,841.00
YEARLY ESCALATOR, NOT TC :
EXCEED 5% 10%
DELIVERY TIME Within one day Within one day
Prepared by \ R \ X\\ ; —
g — s 2 Date;_ - (/<




BID NO: ITB-10-04 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 02/11/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
ANNUAL CONTRACT - BIDDER NO 5 ' BIDDER NO B
GASCLINE/DIESEL FUEL Fleetwing Corporation Lynch Gil Campany, Inc.
EST Lakeland, FL Kissimmes, FL
NITEJGQUANT DESCRIPTION BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE- |PRICE/GAL TOTAL BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE PRICE/GAL TOTAL
FULL LOAD
A 175000|GAL REG E-10 GAS 87 OCTANE  |1.9910 .0485 2.0365 $358,387.50 [1.891 055 2.048 $358,050.00
| 2] 130000 GAL LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL §2.0345 0483 2.0838 $270,894.00 |2.0295 055 2.0845 $270,985.00
TOTAL ITEMS A-B $627,281.50 $629,035.00
TANK WAGON DELIVERIES
C 10000|GAL OFF RD LOW SULFUR 2.0275 A2 2.1475 $21,475.00 (2.0295 .28 2,3095 $23,095.00
DYED DIESEL
| (3] 5000|VARIOUS A2 5600.00 .28 mfuoObj
ALTERNATE BID
IE |UNKNOWN |B99 BIODIESEL FOR BLENDING |[No Bid No Bid zn_ Bid No Bid]
WITH DYED DIESEL FUEL
IF NOT PER GAL DEL FEE,
SPECIFY ADD'L COST PER LOAD No Bid No Bid
FOR BIODIESEL
TOTAL ITEMS A-D $649,356.50 $653,530.00
YEARLY ESCALATOR, NOT TO
EXCEED 10% 0%
DELIVERY TIME Within one day Within one day
Prepared by \\ \
/) \ \x\\ mJ 3 Date: 2- —/ 7 <

\\3 \r\



BID NO: ITB-10-04
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 02/11110

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

ANNUAL CONTRACT - BIDDER NO 7 BIDDER NO &
GASOLINE/DIESEL FUEL Petroleum Traders Corporation Mansfield Qil Company
EST Ft. Wayne, IN Gainasville, GA
JITENQUANT DESCRIPTION BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE [PRICE/GAL TOTAL BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE PRICE/GAL TOTAL
FULL LOAD
A 175000|{GAL REG E-iD GAS 87 OCTANE  |1.9910 0548 2.0458 §358,015.00 |1.9910 0428 20339 5355,932.50
1B 130000 |GAL LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL [2.0345 0586 20931 $272,103.00 |[2.0345 0572 2.0917 $271,921.00
TOTAL ITEMS A-B $630,118.00 $627,853.50
TANK WAGON DELIVERIES

ﬁo 10000|GAL OFF RD LOW SULFUR 2.0345 .1800 2.2145 $22,145.00 [2.0275 1650 2.1925 %21,925.00
DYED DIESEL

 [n 5000 (VARIOUS 1800 $900.00 1650 $825.008

ALTERNATE BID

1IE (UNKNOWN |B99 BIODIESEL FOR BLENDING )2,1300 .0895 2.2295 No Bid No Bid}
WITH DYED DIESEL FUEL
IF NOT PER GAL DEL FEE, ﬁ
SPECIFY ADD'L COST PER LOAD Mo Bid No Bid
FOR BIODIESEL

TOTAL ITEMS A-D $653,163.00 $650,603.50
YEARLY ESCALATOR, NOT TO
EXCEED 10% 5%
DELIVERY TIME Within 10 days
Prepared by
&@\M 4 Date;_2 ~/ 7 <

S

a




BID NO: ITB-10-04 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 02/11/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
ANNUAL CONTRACT - BIDDER NO & BIDDER NO
GASOLINE/DIESEL FUEL Quick Fuel Fleet Service
EST Milwaukes, Wi
{ITENQUANT DESCRIPTION BID RACK PRICE FIXED FEE |[PRICE/GAL TOTAL BID RACK PRICE FIiXED FEE PRICE/GAL TOTAL
FULL LOAD
A 175000|GAL REG E-10 GAS B7 OCTANE  |1.946 .06 2.006 $351,050.00
1B 130000|GAL LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL }2.0345 .06 2.0945 $272,285.00
TOTAL ITEMS A-B $623,335.00
TANK WAGON DELIVERIES
iC 10000|GAL OFF RD LOW SULFUR 2,036 .19 2.226 $22,260.00
DYED DIESEL
| [} 5000|VARIOUS .18 £050.00

ALTERNATE BID

Jm UNKNOWN |B899 BIODIESEL FOR BLENDING [2.05 .10 218
WITH DYED DIESEL FUEL

iF NOT PER GAL DEL FEE,
SPECIFY ADD'L COST PER LOAD Ne Bid
FOR BIODIESEL

TOTAL ITEMS A-D $646,545.00

YEARLY ESCALATOR, NOT TO
EXCEED %

DELIVERY TIME Within one day

Prepared by /4 —
\nﬁ 5 Dmﬁm”Nx (7D




